
7
Nov 30-Dec 6, 2020 l www.vir.com.vn

 

Seck Yee chung
Partner

Baker McKenzie

There are numerous ex-
amples of adaptation and 
growth potential. This in-
cludes factories that switch 

to producing personal pro-
tective equipment instead 
of garments. Also, there is 
growth in the export of elec-
tronic products and furni-
ture, as bolstered by work-
from-home and connectivity 
trends. Agriculture exports 
have also risen.

 Vietnam also sees contin-
ued investment in the renew-
able energy sector, as driven 
and enabled by the govern-
ment’s policy and plans to 
develop this sector. Education 
remains attractive too, as this 
has always been a focus of 
Vietnamese parents.   

 The digital economy is 
another bright spot. There 
is accelerated adoption of 
e-commerce and related on-
line-enabled services such as 
financial and payment ones. 

This in turn has com-
pelled the need to develop, 
and sparked investors’ inter-
est in the logistics and ware-
housing sector to keep pace 
with e-commerce and the 
fulfilment of orders and de-
livery of products.

It is also very encouraging 
to see Vietnam enter into and 
implement its international 
free trade agreements.
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We are accelerating to pro-
mote M&A. Novaland has 
just closed an agreement to 

purchase a 286-hectare proj-
ect in the southern province 
of Dong Nai, worth roughly 
$1 billion. We are aiming to 
build this project into a tour-
ism ecosystem, which will 
benefit our customers in a 
synchronised fashion.

M&A is one of the fast-
est approaches to access new 
capital and increase our foot-
hold in the market, especially 
when the land is “shrinking”. 

However, there are still 
major issues in a dealmaking 
process, particularly in the 
real estate sector. The first one 
is complex legal documents 

on real estate, and the imple-
mentation of the project. 

Secondly, the State Bank 
of Vietnam is tightening its 
loan activities for risk areas. 
For example in reducing the 
rate of short-term deposits 
used for medium- and long-
term loans, which will seri-
ously impede developers. 

On the other hand, the 
market’s reaction to news 
about M&A deals might be 
favourable or unfavourable 
depending on whether other 
participants think the acquirer 
took too much debt from the 
target company.
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One of the main factors that 
has obstructed Vietnamese 
M&A transactions is the le-
gal framework. 

Currently, we have many 
sectors that only accept do-
mestic investors and restrict 
the participation of foreign 
counterparts. 

The second barrier 
comes from unclear provi-
sions of the Law on Com-
petition. Terms such as 
“relevant market” are very 
general and not well defined, 
causing many deals between 
large investors to be halted. 

In the coming time, I 
think that M&A activities in 
tourism real estate shall be 
boosted because this area is 
facing financial difficulties. 

Other sectors such as re-
tail, pharmacy, healthcare, 
online education, and fintech 
are all potential fields that 
need finance when growing. 

In addition, the energy 
sector is also interesting for 
many foreign investors, es-
pecially from Japan, Hong 
Kong, and China. 

Vietnam is one of the 
few nations in Southeast 
Asia to record positive eco-
nomic growth in 2020, and 
the stringent disease control 
measures have led many to 
consider Vietnam a safe in-
vestment destination.

Tran ngoc han  
Senior associate 

Russin & Vecchi Vietnam

In order to enhance the in-
vestment environment, the 
National Assembly passed 
the new Law on Enterprises 

which will also come into 
effect in January. It will com-
plete the legal framework on 
corporate governance and 
help Vietnam reach interna-
tional standards and common 
practices.

It has also abolished 
several unnecessary admin-
istrative procedures and 
strengthened the protection 
of investors. This improves 
management efficiency and 
minimises costs, especially 
in corporate reorganisations. 

In addition, the govern-
ment has issued a series of 
resolutions aimed at bol-

stering economic stability, 
improving the business en-
vironment, and enhancing 
national competitiveness. It 
is another signal confirming 
the government’s efforts to 
enhance investment here.

The government has pro-
vided support to investors 
and businesses by reducing 
administrative burdens. Be-
sides that, Vietnam has con-
tinued to benefit from gen-
eral US and European trends 
of moving production out of 
China. This will yield Viet-
nam more opportunities to 
attract investors.n

By Thanh Van

Vietnam is expect-
ed to welcome a 
growing wave of 
dealmaking in-

volving Japanese companies 
and investors as the pandem-
ic subsides.

Speaking at the Vietnam 
M&A Forum 2020 last week, 
Masataka “Sam” Yoshida, 
head of the Cross-border Di-
vision of RECOF Corpora-
tion and CEO of RECOF Viet-
nam Co., Ltd. – said that 
investment via mergers and 
acquisitions (M&A) into 
Vietnam will be a trendy ac-
tivity for Japanese companies 
which have the potential to 
last for years to come.

“The first trigger for such 
an opinion is the destiny 
for Japanese companies to 
find new markets to expand 
outside their own country,” 
Yoshida explained.  

Most sectors in Japan are 
already well matured – for 
instance, almost one-third of 
the Japanese population is 
over 65 years old, making the 
Japanese average age almost 
20 years older than the Viet-
namese equivalent.

“The second trigger is us-
ing M&A as a growth strat-
egy, which is backed up by 
the abundant accumulated 
cash during the last 20 years 
– reaching $2.34 trillion as 
bank deposits with almost 
zero interest rate,” he said. 

“Pushed by shareholders’ 
requirements to make use of 
money, it has started to flow 
into the M&A market which 
made its highest record in 
2019 by over 4,000 deals 
in all types of M&A. This 
means there were more than 
4,000 active and successful 
Japanese investors,” he said.

Indeed, Yoshida not-
ed that there are a growing 

number of M&A transac-
tions between Japanese in-
vestors and companies in 
most of countries in South-
east Asia. Among them, 
Vietnam recorded the high-
est number ever with 33 
transactions last year.

In the past, due to the 
size of businesses, Vietnam 
was often outside the top 
three countries in this re-

gard, but in 2019 it reached 
an amount of $389 million 
– 2.8 times higher than in 
2017 and, for the first time, 
ranked just behind Indone-
sia in second.

During the first 10 months 
in 2020, there were 21 trans-
actions publicly announced 
between Japan and Vietnam, 
ranking second in number af-
ter Singapore. Although there 

was an on-year 25-per-cent 
decline, given that the total 
of outbound Japanese deals 
dropped by 33 per cent during 
this period, the Vietnamese 
decline was both smaller than 
the average and also less than 
most other countries. In terms 
of transaction value, Vietnam 
was ranked second at a value 
of $282 million. 

“We can say that the in-
terest from Japanese inves-
tors towards Vietnam contin-
ues to be strong even in the 
pandemic situation, and the 
background of a slowdown of 
investment is purely a timing 
issue,” Yoshida insisted.

In fact, there has been 
a surge in Japanese-driven 
M&A deals across the world 
over the last five years. In 
2019, all categories record-
ed a historical high. In 2020, 
the domestic M&A market 
was hit by COVID-19 with 
a 4-per-cent on-year dip up 
to October. However, the 
Japanese market already bot-
tomed out in May, and now 
the monthly number has al-
most recovered to the previ-
ous year’s level.

Outbound M&A was 
particularly hard hit and has 

been slow in recovering, with 
on-year decline of around 
33 per cent up to last month 
mainly due to worldwide bor-
der restrictions.

“From a Japanese point of 
view, their companies already 
have very little to do in a mar-
ket like Thailand.  There are 
already about 5,500 Japanese 
companies in the country and 
it is too late to enter. As for 
somewhere like Myanmar, 
there are fewer than 400 Jap-
anese companies and so con-
servative investors still have 
to wait and see carefully re-
garding appropriate timing,” 
Yoshida said. 

On the other hand, Viet-
nam, with more than 2,000 
Japanese companies in the 
country, will continue to at-
tract them. New Japanese 
Prime Minister Suga Yoshi-
hide is following the pol-
icy of his predecessor and 
demonstrated his commit-
ment to Vietnam by choosing 
the country as his first des-
tination to visit while in the 
role. “This endorsement to 
Vietnam will create an enor-
mous impact to the Japanese 
companies’ future strate-
gies,” Yoshida explained.

“Once the hurdle of an-
ti-pandemic restrictions on 
business activities are re-
moved, a big wave of Jap-
anese companies waiting to 
make progress on invest-
ment procedures will rise,” 
he said.n

Jackpot within reach for 
keen Japanese investors

More Japanese companies desperately need to find additional markets to expand in

Ph
oto

: L
e T

oa
n


